
BLM RANKS NUMBER 1 IN GOVERNANCE PERFOMANCE INDEX - SOUTH 
AFRICA 2024 
 
When taking office in 2021, Blouberg Local Municipality Mayor, Her Worship Cllr 
Maria Thamaga indicated that, the ultimate goal of the Council is to achieve better 
audit outcomes and have a clean administration that will be able to effectively deliver 
services to communities. That was not far-fetched. Last week, the Good Governance 
Africa (GGA) through its Government Perfomance Index (GPI) -  2024 ranking, has 
ranked the Blouberg Local Municipality Number 1 for the municipality's outstanding 
performance in Category B4 - Mostly Rural Local Municipalities. 
 
GGA exists in Africa with the aim to improve governance performance across the 
African continent. 
For 2024, all South African municipalities were evaluated according to four 
categories namely; Administration and Governance, Leadership and 
Governance,  Planning and Monitoring as well as Service Delivery. Service delivery 
was weighted most due to the importance that the constitution and associated 
legislative frameworks stress on the role which local government has in terms of 
distributing core services to households. 
 
Mayor Thamaga has welcomed the ranking status and credited the management for 
working tirelessly to ensure that Blouberg Local Municipality    excel when coming to 
governance. Mayor Thamaga further indicated that, the municipality will continue to 
strive for good financial governance whilst delivering sustainable services to 
communities. 
 
" We rely on the expertise and advices of management to make things work in our 
municipality, maintain good governance whilst delivering sustainable services to our 
communities. We thank the GGA for recognizing our efforts. There is no looking 
back, forward is where we are going until we get it right. Thanks to the administration 
team of Blouberg Local Municipality led by Ntate Refilwe Ramothwala. 
Let us continue deliverying services and make an impact in our communities". 
 
The GGA ranking data was sourced from Auditor General Municipal Finance 
Management Act (MFMA) reports 2021/2022, National Treasury Municipal Money 
Database, Financial Census of Municipalities (Quarter 3, 2023), Census 2022 and 
Community Survey 2016 among other references. 
 



 


